
 $                5,964.63000  $                        1,055.49900  $                           9,683.20000  $                    1,631.01289 

BRAND/STK NO  NO BID  NO BID VWR INTERNATIONAL 76093-882
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  NO BID  NO BID CASE OF 500 NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  NO BID  NO BID 67.00000$                                    0.13400$                               

BRAND/STK NO  KOVA  22-270141 KOVA 45000-122
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  100/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 100 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      110.11000  $                                   1.10000 89.23000$                                    0.89230$                               

BRAND/STK NO  QUIDEL  22-043045 HARDY DIAGNOSTICS 75813-918
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1 EACH  1 EACH EACH OF 200 ML NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        23.95000  $                                 23.95000 35.79000$                                    35.79000$                             

BRAND/STK NO  SIEMENS  23-042305 SIEMENS 10789-338
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  100/PACK  1 PACK VIAL OF 100 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        47.50000  $                                   0.48000 39.98000$                                    0.39980$                               

BRAND/STK NO  NEW ERIE 12-550D VWR INTERNATIONAL 48300-026
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  144/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 72 NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        20.18000  $                                   0.14000 12.06000$                                    0.16750$                               

BRAND/STK NO  GLOBE SCIENTIFIC  22-170-302 VWR INTERNATIONAL 89500-472
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1440/CASE  1 CASE PACK OF 72 NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        76.17000  $                                   0.05000 4.65000$                                      0.06458$                               

BRAND/STK NO  BULBTRONICSS  NC1741488 BULBTRONICS 47738-322
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1 EACH  1 EACH EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                          2.52000  $                                   2.52000 3.67000$                                      3.67000$                               

BRAND/STK NO  GLOBE   NC1761631 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC INC 10022-152
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1000/CASE  1 CASE PACK OF 100 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        34.98000  $                                   0.03000 35.02000$                                    0.35020$                               

BRAND/STK NO  NO BID  NO BID VWR INTERNATIONAL 21008-035
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  NO BID  NO BID CASE OF 1000 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  NO BID  NO BID 90.28000$                                    0.09028$                               

BRAND/STK NO  RAYLABCON 11-996 VWR INTERNATIONAL 52846-001
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  600 SHEETS/PACK  1 PACK 50 SHEETS/BOOK, 12 BOOKS/PACK NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        10.57000  $                                   0.02000 28.13000$                                    0.04688$                               

BRAND/STK NO  DWK LIFE SCIENCES 02-678 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC 60820-114
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  10/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 10 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        19.17000  $                                   1.92000 28.94000$                                    2.89400$                               

BRAND/STK NO  SIEMENS ARN2591 SIEMENS AM2591
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  100/BOTTLE  1 BOTTLE EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        61.84000  $                                   0.62000 52.03000$                                    52.03000$                             

BRAND/STK NO  SIEMENS NC1006045 SKLAR CORP. 10193-464
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1 EACH  1 EACH EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        19.59000  $                                 19.59000 36.2000$                                      36.2000$                               

BRAND/STK NO  GLOBE 22-010-010 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC INC 89206-962
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1000/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 1000 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        22.21000  $                                   0.02000 23.2300$                                      0.0232$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  ANDWIN 50-930-487 ACL STATICIDE 75780-007
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1 EACH  1 EACH EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        21.62000  $                                 21.62000 10.0700$                                      10.0700$                               

URINE REAGENT STRIP MULTISTIX® 10 SG GLUCOSE, BILIRUBIN, KETONE, SPECIFIC GRAVITY, BLOOD, PH, PROTEIN, UROBILINOGEN, 
NITRITE, LEUCOCYTES 100 STRIPS | MFG.: SIEMENS | MFG. # 10336425 NO SUBSTITUTE

MICROSCOPE SLIDE MCKESSON 25 X 75 X 1 MM PLAIN | MFG.: MCKESSON | MFG.# 70-101PMCK

MICROSCOPE SLIDE 25 X 75 X 1 MM FROSTED END | MFG.: GLOBE SCIENTIFIC | MFG. # 1304

TUBE, CENTRIFUGE POLYN PLUG CAP 15ML (500/CS) | MFG.: STOCKWELL SCIENTIFIC| MFG. # 8514

 VWR INTERNATIONAL 

IDENTI-TRAY, CRITOSEAL (6/PK) |Mfg.:  VWR | Mfg. # 18000-299

PAPER, LENS PAPER, 4 X 6 INCH OPTICAL INSTRUMENT LENS |MFG.:  GRAHAM - FIELD | MFG. # 3719

ICTOTEST TAB 100TST/BX 100/BX 6BX/CS URINE DIPSTICK | Mfg.: Siemens | Mfg. # 10337316

URINALYSIS MICROSCOPE SLIDE KOVA® GLASSTIC® SLIDE 10 WITH GRID 10-CHAMBER PLAIN | MFG.: KOVA | MFG. # 87144

URINE CHEMISTRY CONTROL SET QUICKVUE® ONE-STEP PREGNANCY (HCG) TESTING POSITIVE / NEGATIVE 2 X 4.5 ML | MFG.: QUIDELL | 
MFG. # 00272

PIPET SEROLOGICAL 2ML 500/CS | Mfg.: GLOBE SCIENTIFIC | Mfg. # 1720

 FISHER SCIENTIFIC 
1 2

Bid Tabulation

PLATE, HOLD DOWN F/CLINITEX ADVANTAS URINALYSIS ANALYZ |Mfg.: Siemens| Mfg. # 10713955

CAPPERS™ TUBE CLOSURE POLYETHYLENE DUAL TAB LAVENDER FOR 13 MM GLASS EVACUATED BLOOD DRAWING TUBE / 12 MM 
PLASTIC TEST TUBE NONSTERILE | MFG.: GLOBE SCIENTIFIC | MFG. # 113140L

POWER DUSTER, 10 OZ CAN |MFG.:  PERFECT DUSTER | MFG. # PDC - 1058421

HALOGEN LAMP OSRAM 6 VOLTS 20 WATTS | MFG.: BULBTRONICS | MFG. # 0000861

CAPILLARY BLOOD COLLECTION TUBE MICRO-HEMATOCRIT PLAIN 1.15 X 75 MM 75 µL BLUE STRIPE WITHOUT CLOSURE GLASS TUBE | 
MFG.: GLOBE SCIENTIFIC| MFG. # 51602
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GRAND TOTAL

BRAND/STK NO  FOX WEST S66878 FOXWEST PC 10611-616
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  6/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 6 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        17.40000  $                                   2.90000 24.4000$                                      4.0667$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  SHAMROCK UPCR-9900 SHAMROCK SCIENTIFIC MISC-LIQUIDHND
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  EACH  1 EACH 1 ROLL NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        25.00000  $                                 25.00000 23.4200$                                      23.4200$                               

BRAND/STK NO  SHAMROCK UPCR-3007 SHAMROCK SCIENTIFIC MISC-LIQUIDHND
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  EACH  1 EACH 1 ROLL NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        25.00000  $                                 25.00000 23.4200$                                      23.4200$                               

BRAND/STK NO  TSI NC1565154 MARKET LAB INC. MISC-LIQUIDHND
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  EACH  1 EACH 1 ROLL NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      192.20000  $                               192.20000 48.19000$                                    48.19000$                             

BRAND/STK NO  SHAMROCK UPCR-1020 SHAMROCK SCIENTIFIC MISC-LIQUIDHND
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  EACH  1 EACH 1 ROLL NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        23.00000  $                                 23.00000 23.4200$                                      23.4200$                               

BRAND/STK NO  DECON 04-355 ALCONOX INC. 89233-152
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1 EACH  1/EACH EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        18.37000  $                                 18.37000 18.7500$                                      18.7500$                               

BRAND/STK NO  THERMO FISHER A33F16AL VWR INTERNATIONAL BDH1135-4LP
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  EACH  1 EACH EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        26.50000  $                                 26.50000 27.2700$                                      27.2700$                               

BRAND/STK NO  RICCA 7996-4 RICCA CHEMICAL CO. RC79964
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  EACH  1 EACH EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        11.15000  $                                 11.15000 15.8300$                                      15.8300$                               

BRAND/STK NO  WERFEN 22-211-510 NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  100/PACK  1 PACK NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      135.54000  $                                   1.36000 NO BID NO BID

BRAND/STK NO  NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID

BRAND/STK NO  THERMO FISHER  23-038-384 MICROGENICS CORP. 89130-672
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  4/PACK  1 PACK 4X60ML NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      121.56000  $                                 30.39000 120.5700$                                    30.1425$                               

BRAND/STK NO  THERMO FISHER  23-038-385 MICROGENICS CORP. 89130-676
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  4/PACK  1 PACK 4X60ML NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      121.56000  $                                 30.39000 111.0400$                                    27.7600$                               

BRAND/STK NO  ENTERIX  22-823-005 THERMO ORION 23198-306
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  35/PACK  1 PACK EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      192.96000  $                                   5.51000 152.1200$                                    152.1200$                             

BRAND/STK NO  ENTERIX  22-823-006 HEMOCUE AMERICA 89013-352
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  2/PACK  1 PACK CASE OF 4 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        70.28000  $                                 35.14000 198.55000$                                  49.63750$                             

BRAND/STK NO  ENTERIX  22-823-001 PROPPER MFG CO. INC. 14230-048
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  25/PACK  1 PACK CASE OF 100 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      145.26000  $                                   5.81000 161.2200$                                    1.6122$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  NO BID  NO BID POLYMEDCO, INC. 75784-760
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  NO BID  NO BID PACK OF 20 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  NO BID  NO BID 37.20000$                                    1.86000$                               

PAPER BLEED BLOTTING SURGICUTT

TUBE SHIELD MEDISPIN | MFG.: KENDRO LABORATORY PRODUCTS | MFG. # 015050R

MAS UA LEVEL 1 60ML | MFG.: MICROGENICS | MFG. # UAB-160

MAS UA LEVEL 2 60ML |MFG.: MICROGENICS | MFG. # UAB - 260

LABORATORY LABEL GENERAL ALERT DATE / _____ / OPENED FLUORESCENT CHARTREUSE 3/4 INCH DIAMETER | MFG.: SHAMROCK 
SCIENTIFIC | MFG. # UPCR-9900

LABEL, NEW LOT DO NOT USE FLRCNT ORG (500/RL) |MFG.:  SHAMROCK SCIENTIFIC | MFG.# UPCR-3007

LABEL DO NOT USE RL=EA | MFG.: MARKET LAB | MFG. # 8032

INSURE FIT DEVELOPER KIT 25 TESTS | MFG.: ENTERIX, INC. | 80025B

INSURE FIT 10 PACK COLLECTION KIT | MFG.: ENTERIX, INC. | MFG. # 900100

COMBO KIT 90010 90025 80025 | MFG.: ENTERIX, INC. | MFG. # 90035

FOBT CONTROLS TWO BOTTLE ONE POS ONE NEG | MFG.: ENTERIX, INC. | MFG. # 16800

SPINAL DILUTING FLUID, 4 OZ., | MFG.: RICCA CHEMICAL CO. | 7996-4

CLEANER, LENS OPTICAL BO 59ML (6/PK) |Mfg.:  Fisher| Mfg. # S66878

LABORATORY LABEL PATIENT ALERT NAME ALERT FLUORESCENT RED 5-16 X 1-1/4 INCH |MFG.:  SHAMROCK SCIENTIFIC | MFG.# UPCR-
1020

DECON*CONTRAD* INSTRUMENT DETERGENT LIQUID 1 LITER BOTTLE |MFG.:  FISHER | MFG. # 4355

METHANOL S/P 1 GAL | MFG.: CARDINAL HEALTH | MFG. # C4324
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 FISHER SCIENTIFIC 
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BRAND/STK NO  ENTERIX  22-823-003 CLARITY DIAGNOSTICS, LLC. 95064-042
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  25/PACK  1 PACK EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        63.76000  $                                   2.55000 108.7100$                                    108.7100$                             

BRAND/STK NO  NO BID  NO BID SIEMENS AM2591
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  NO BID  NO BID EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  NO BID  NO BID 52.0300$                                      52.0300$                               

BRAND/STK NO  ITW  18-385 ITW-TEXWIPE CO. TWTX761
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  100/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 100 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        26.17000  $                                   0.26000 27.6200$                                      0.2762$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  CURRENT TECH 14-412-526 CURRENT TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 16200-210
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  150/PACK  1 PACK CASE OF 1800 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                          8.20000  $                                   0.05000 93.1000$                                      0.0517$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  CURRENT TECH 14-512-52H CURRENT TECHNOLOGIES, INC. 16200-212
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  150/PACK  1 PACK CASE OF 1800 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                          7.06000  $                                   0.05000 78.3000$                                      0.0435$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  CENTRAL INFUSION  NC0821671 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC INC 60820-064
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1000/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 1000 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        54.38000  $                                   0.05000 24.4800$                                      0.0244$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  HEMOCUE 22-274915 HEMOCUE AMERICA 87002-122
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  40/PACK  1 PACK BAG OF 40 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      160.66000  $                                   4.02000 185.93000$                                  4.64825$                               

BRAND/STK NO  THERMO FISHER 02-707-17 BIO PLAS INC. 89499-990
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1000/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 500 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        21.86000  $                                   0.02000 31.36000$                                    0.06272$                               

BRAND/STK NO  THERMO FISHER 02-707-18 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC INC 89206-992
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1000/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 1000 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        21.86000  $                                   0.02000 35.29000$                                    0.03529$                               

BRAND/STK NO  NO BID  NO BID BD MISC-LIFESCI
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  NO BID  NO BID CASE OF 1000 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  NO BID  NO BID 381.8100$                                    0.3818$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  KIMBERLY CLARK  06-666A VWR INTERNATIONAL 82003-820
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  280/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 280 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                          2.54000  $                                   2.54000 3.40000$                                      0.01214$                               

BRAND/STK NO  CARDINAL   22-037-978 VWR INTERNATIONAL 82004-826
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  8000/CASE  1 CASE CASE OF 8000 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        33.81000  $                                   0.00400 168.66000$                                  0.02108$                               

BRAND/STK NO  CARDINAL   02-544-26 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC INC 89206-986
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1000/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 1000 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        29.44000  $                                   0.03000 35.29000$                                    0.03529$                               

BRAND/STK NO  VISTALAB  21-341 VISTALAB TECHNOLOGIES 53514-128
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1000/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 1000 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        54.43000  $                                   0.05000 52.09000$                                    0.05209$                               

BRAND/STK NO  VISTALAB  21-343 VISTALAB TECHNOLOGIES 53514-130
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  600/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 600 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        44.38000  $                                   0.74000 65.57000$                                    0.10928$                               

46

EZEE-NEST SAMPLE CUPS 13MM | MFG.: TYCO HEALTHCARE \ KENDALL | MFG. # 1270013000

REAGENT LIPOCLEAR 0.5ML SAMPLE | MFG. HEMOCUE AMERICA | MFG.# LC40

WIPE BIOHAZ SUPER ABSORBENT 3X3 S/P | MFG.: CARDINAL HEALTH | MFG. # BH91033

INSURE FIT 25 PACK COLLECTION KIT | MFG.: ENTERIX | MFG. # 90025

TABLET ACETEST REAGENT | MFG.: ASCENSIA DIABETES CARE US, INC. | MFG. # 2381

SWAB CLEANING VALIDATION KNIT POLYESTER | MFG. TEXWIPE | MFG. # TX761
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WIPE BIOHAZ SUPER ABSORBENT 4X4 S/P | MFG.: CARDINAL HEALTH | MFG. # BH90044
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TIP MLA STACKED RACK SM 1000PK | MFG.: VISTALAB TECHNOLOGIES, INC.  | MFG. # 9025

TIP PIPET DISP MLA STCK RK L | VISTALAB TECHNOLOGIES, INC. | MFG. # 9026

45

CAP CLOSURE SP VERSA UNIVERSAL NATURAL | MFG.: CARDINAL HEALTH | MFG. # A20007ALG

TOP SNAP CAP CLOSURE RED FOR 13MM | MFG.: CARDINAL HEALTH | MFG. # B3035-81V NO SUBSTITUTE 	

HOLDER TUBE MICROTAINER | MFG.: BECTON DICKINSON | MFG. # 366270

WIPER DISP 4 1/2INX8 1/2IN KIMWIPES WHT | MFG.: KIMBERLY CLARK PROF. HLTHCR. | MFG. # 34155

DERMACEA 2X2 12PLY NS | MFG.: TYCO HEALTHCARE / KENDALL | MFG. # 441218

TOP SNAP CAP CLOSURE BLUE FOR 13MM | MFG.: CARDINAL HEALTH | MFG. # B3035-82V NO SUBSTITUTE
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BRAND/STK NO  BEMIS  13-374-10 HEATHROW SCIENTIFIC 52858-000
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  125 FT/ROLL  1 ROLL 1 ROLL NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        27.70000  0.22/FT 52.8100$                                      52.8100$                               

BRAND/STK NO  CORNING  13-676-34D CORNING 53284-620
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  720/CASE  1 CASE PACK OF 720 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      270.33000  $                                   0.38000 336.2200$                                    0.4670$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  THERMO FISHER  14-809-41 VWR INTERNATIONAL 89215-752
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1 EACH  1 EACH EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        27.34000  $                                 27.74000 17.8800$                                      17.8800$                               

BRAND/STK NO  NO BID  NO BID VWR INTERNATIONAL 82007-200
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  NO BID  NO BID PACK OF 250 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  NO BID  NO BID 17.70000$                                    0.07080$                               

BRAND/STK NO  VISTALAB  21-318-602 VISTALAB TECHNOLOGIES 53514-144
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  100/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 100 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        22.44000  $                                   0.22000 40.0000$                                      0.4000$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  BD  22-727891 BD 90003-970
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  10/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 10 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        36.69000  $                                   3.67000 59.72000$                                    5.97200$                               

BRAND/STK NO  BD  22-349-689 BD 90003-942
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  500/PACK  1 EACH 1 KIT NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      294.39000  $                                   0.59000 312.43000$                                  312.43000$                           

BRAND/STK NO  BD  L270309B BD 90003-834
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  10/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 10 AMPULES NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      918.90000  $                                 91.89000 1,045.7800$                                 104.5780$                             

BRAND/STK NO  QUIDEL  QW010 QUIDEL CORP. MISC-NONCORDES
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  30/PACK  1 PACK 1 KIT OF 30 TESTS NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      360.97000  $                                 12.03000 316.27000$                                  10.54233$                             

BRAND/STK NO  THERMO FISHER  13-711-7M VWR INTERNATIONAL 16001-188
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  500/CASE  1 CASE PACK OF 500 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      123.22000  $                                   0.25000 40.7900$                                      0.0816$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  CONTROL CO.  06-662-47 VWR INTERNATIONAL 61161-340
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1 EACH  1 EACH EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        17.05000  $                                 17.05000 23.7900$                                      23.7900$                               

BRAND/STK NO  DWK  14-961-26 CARDINAL HEALTH MISC-CLINICAL
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1000/CASE  1 CASE CASE OF 1000 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        30.71000  $                                   0.04000 84.9000$                                      0.0849$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

BRAND/STK NO  CORNING  13-676-10B VWR INTERNATIONAL 75816-102
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1000/CASE  1 CASE CASE OF 500 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        79.56000  $                                   0.08000 132.68000$                                  0.26536$                               

BRAND/STK NO  KOVA  22-270141 KOVA 45000-122
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  100/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 100 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      110.11000  $                                   1.10000 89.23000$                                    0.89230$                               
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60

PIPET GEN PURPOSE 3.2ML DRAW | MFG.: CARDINAL HEALTH | MFG. # P5214-10V

50

47

MICROHEMATOCRIT CENTRIFUGE CUSHIONS | MRG. IEC | MFG. #1505

59

52

KIT RPR CARD TEST NO 110 500 TESTS | MFG.: BECTON DICKINSON DIAGNOSTIC SYSTEMS | MFG. # 275005 NO SUBSTITUTE

TIMER S/P TRACEABLE STANDUP BLACK 1/EA | MFG.: CARDINAL HEALTH | MFG. # 5022

TUBE CULTURE DISPO BORO 12X75MM S/P | MFG.: CARDINAL HEALTH | MFG. # SP1290-3

51

TIP MLA MACRO GRAD 1-5ML 100PK | MFG.: VISTALAB TECHNOLOGIES | MFG.# 9048 NO SUBSTITUTE

CARD RPR 18MM CONTROL | MFG.: BECKTON DICKINSON DIAGNOSTIC SYSTEMS | MFG. # 276709 NO SUBSTITUTE

AMPULE RPR CARD ANTIGEN SUSPENSION 3ML | MFG.: BECTON DICKINSON DIAGNOSTIC SYSTEMS | MFG. # 270309 NO SUBSTITUTE

TEST QUICKVUE 30S H PYLORI GII | MFG.: QUIDEL CORP. | MFG.# 0W010 NO SUBSTITUTE

 PIPETS, DISPOSABLE PLASTIC SEROLOGICAL | MFG. CARDINAL | MFG. # P4676-1X 

KOVA GLASSTIC SLIDE 10 W/ GRIDS 100/PKG 87144 | MFG. CARDINAL | MFG.# U3050-18

53

PARAFILM 4IN WIDE 125FT/ROLL | MFG.: CURWOOD (A DIVISION OF BEMIS CO. , INC.) | MFG. # PM996

PIPET SEROLOGICAL 10ML NO PLUG NONSTERLE | MFG. CORNING LIFE SCIENCES | MFG. # 7079-10N

TIP PIPETTE SP 1000-5000UL MLA NAT BK | MFG. CARDINAL HEALTH | MFG. # 090-8

RACK UNWIRE TEST TUBE BLUE 13MM | MFG.: NALGE NUNC INTERNATIONAL | MFG.# 5970-0313

49

48
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 $                5,964.63000  $                        1,055.49900  $                           9,683.20000  $                    1,631.01289 
 VWR INTERNATIONAL 

           

 FISHER SCIENTIFIC 
GRAND TOTAL

BRAND/STK NO  STRECK  23-046581 STRECK LABORATORIES 87005-200
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  12/PACK  1 PACK BOX OF 12 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      330.88000  $                                 27.57000 385.85000$                                  32.15416$                             

BRAND/STK NO  STRECK  11-716-331 STRECK LABORATORIES 87005-248
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  4/PACK  1 PACK BOX OF 4 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      144.75000  $                                 36.19000 170.6600$                                    42.6650$                               

BRAND/STK NO  ELITECH  NC9416394 ELITECH GROUP INC. FOR WESCOR MSPP-SS035A
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  EACH  1 EACH EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        19.56000  $                                 19.56000 20.4800$                                      20.4800$                               

BRAND/STK NO  ELITECH  NC9925872 ELITECH GROUP INC. FOR WESCOR MSPP-SS113
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  48/CASE  1 CASE PACK OF 48 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      153.97000  $                                   3.21000 159.8600$                                    3.3304$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  ELITECH  NC9926284 ELITECH GROUP INC. FOR WESCOR MSPP-SS114
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1 EACH  1 EACH PACK OF 48 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      153.97000  $                               153.97000 159.8600$                                    3.3304$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  ELITECH  NC1691361 ELITECH GROUP INC. FOR WESCOR MSPP-SS035049B
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1 EACH  1 EACH EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        19.55000  $                                 19.55000 20.30000$                                    20.30000$                             

BRAND/STK NO  ELITECH  NC9416396 ELITECH GROUP INC. FOR WESCOR MSPP-SS035C
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1 EACH  1 EACH EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        19.56000  $                                 19.56000 20.30000$                                    20.30000$                             

BRAND/STK NO  ELITECH  NC9461832 ELITECH GROUP INC. FOR WESCOR MISC-NONCORDFS
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  EACH  1 EACH EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        54.47000  $                                 54.47000 52.5300$                                      52.5300$                               

BRAND/STK NO  ELITECH  NC9985046 ELITECH GROUP INC. FOR WESCOR MSPP-SS029
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1 EACH  1 EACH EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        41.80000  $                                 41.80000 39.9000$                                      39.9000$                               

BRAND/STK NO  THERMO FISHER  02-707-24 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC INC 89206-986
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1000/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 1000 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        20.49000  $                                   0.02000 35.2900$                                      0.0353$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  THERMO FISHER  02-707-19 GLOBE SCIENTIFIC INC 89206-990
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1000/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 1000 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                      252.19000  $                                   0.25000 35.29000$                                    0.03529$                               

BRAND/STK NO  MARKET LAB  NC1715998 MARKET LAB INC. MISC-NONCORDFS
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  1000/PACK  1 PACK 1 ROLL NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        36.74000  $                                   0.04000 44.58000$                                    44.58000$                             

BRAND/STK NO  ENTERIX  22-823-007 PROPPER MFG CO. INC. 10753-458
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  50/PACK  1 PACK BOX OF 100 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        79.90000  $                                   1.60000 67.3700$                                      0.6737$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  DYNAREX  19-293451 CARDINAL HEALTH MISC-CLINICAL
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  5000/CASE  1 CASE CASE OF 8000 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        25.89000  $                                   0.00500 25.41000$                                    0.00318$                               

BRAND/STK NO  THERMO FISHER  13-711-7M VWR INTERNATIONAL 16001-188
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  5000/PACK  1 PACK PACK OF 500 EACH  NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        12.31000  $                                   0.02000 40.7900$                                      0.0816$                                 

BRAND/STK NO  ELITECH  23-024-623 ELITECH GROUP INC. FOR WESCOR MISC-NONCORDFS
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  50/PACK  1 PACK BOX OF 50 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        66.76000  $                                   1.34000 62.1100$                                      1.2522$                                 

ESR VACUUM TUBES   50/ BOX  EP-10605B

74

72

SAMPLE CHAMBER, TAN 48/PKG | MFG. WESCOR | MFG. #SS-114, NO SUBSTITUTE

67

62

63

66

STRECK ESR CHEX BILEVEL 10X8.5 ML QC  ACCU-SED ESR #214112 | MFG. CARDINAL | MFG.# B5020-30P

73

71

64

HEMATOLOGY CONTROL CELL-CHEX™ CELL BODY FLUID SPINAL AND BODY F  LUID 2 LEVELS 4 X 2 ML | MFG.: STRECK LABORATORIES | 
MFG. # 212420 NO SUBSTITUTE

REAGENT B-THIAZIN STAIN 500 ML | MFG. WESCOR | MFG. #SS-035/049B, NO SUBSTITUTE

65

68

69

70

REAGENT C-EOSIN STAIN 500 ML | MFG. WESCOR | MFG. #SS-035C, NO SUBSTITUTE

AEROFIX ADDITIVE 60 ML | MFG. WESCOR | MFG. #SS-148, NO SUBSTITUTE  

REAGENT A-RINSE REAGENT 500 ML | MFG. WESCOR | MFG. # SS-035A, NO SUBSTITUTE

SAMPLE CHAMBER, WHITE 48/PKG | MFG. WESCOR | MFG.  #SS-113, NO SUBSTITUTE

75

76

77

TRANSFER PIPETS | MFG. CARDINAL | MFG. # P5214-10V

AEROSPRAY NOZZLE CLEANING 355 ML  | MFG. WESCOR | MFG. #SS-029, NO SUBSTITUTE

EZEE TOPPER PROTECTIVE CAPS 13MM, 1000/PKG, BLUE | MFG. #B3035-82     

EZEE TOPPER PROTECTIVE CAPS 13MM, 1000/PKG, LAVENDER | MFG. #B3035-85V NO SUBSTITUTE

LAST IN BOX LABELS  | MFG.  MARKETLAB  | MFG.  #ML9109

INSURE FIT TEST CARDS FOR QC 50 PACK  | MFG.   ENTERI  | MFG.  #11018

GAUZE, 2X2, NON-STERILE, 12-PLY BULK,   | MFG. CARDINAL   | MFG.  # KC441218A
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 $                5,964.63000  $                        1,055.49900  $                           9,683.20000  $                    1,631.01289 
 VWR INTERNATIONAL 

           

 FISHER SCIENTIFIC 
GRAND TOTAL

BRAND/STK NO
 THERMO FISHER  17-100-809A VWR INTERNATIONAL

414004-366 (SM) 414004-362 (MD) 
414004-363 (LG)  414004-356 (XL)

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  10/PACK  1 PACK CASE OF 30 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH 

 $                        48.22000  $                                   4.82000 
 $63.37 (SM)    $109.07 (MD)          $109.19 

(LG), $104.52 (XL) 
 $2.1123 (SM) $3.6356 (MD)              
$3.6396 (LG)  $3.484 (XL) 

BRAND/STK NO  ALERE  23-900-530 CARDINAL HEALTH MISC-CLINICAL
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER  30/PACK  1 PACK BOX OF 30 EACH NO MIN ORDER QTY
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH  $                        39.47000  $                                   1.32000 1,868.4600$                                 62.2820$                               

1 Fissher Scientific

2 VWR International, Inc. 

79

CARDINAL BRAND HCG COMBOSERUM/URINE HCG PREGNANCY  30/KIT   B1077-23 NO SUBSTITUTE

78

DISPOSABLE LAB COATS FLUID RESISTANT SIZES S, M, L, XL

REQUIRED FORMS
YESNotification of Intent to Respond

Non-Collusion Affidavit

N/A

Negotiable Upon Award

Negotiable Upon Award

YESPrice Sheet

Delivery guaranteed not later than __  days after order 10 DAYS 

YES

5 DAYS 

Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is 
renewed for 2nd year _0_ %.
Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is 
renewed for 3rd year _0_ %.

N/A

YES

MAXIMUM DISCOUNT

4500 Turnberry Drive, Hanover Park, IL 60133 | Malik Durram   P: 800.766.7000   E: cs.quotes@thermofisher.com

EEOC Form
Affidavit of Contractor

YES
YES

YES
Debarment Statement

100 Matsonford Road, Radnor, PA 19087 | Amy Cook  P:  800.932.5000   E: amy.cook@avantorsciences.com 

CONTACT INFORMATION

YES
YES
YES
YES
YES
YES

Signature Page

YES
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